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Director Malwina Holownia, MPharm, Director International Affairs 

Director Andrey Vorobiev, Director of Economics, 

# Members 1731 

Describe your Chapter's accomplishments for 2015 with 
regard to Scientific and Educational activities. 

Were held the School of the Formulary Committee, a 
series of lectures on the HTA in the FMBA of Russia, 
series of lectures on modeling, clinical and economic 
analysis and HTA in hospitals of Moscow and the 
Moscow region.  Several studies: HTA «Sulodexide», 
HTA «Use of the drug Fondaparinux sodium in patients 
with acute coronary syndrome», HTA «Use of the drug 
«Foster» for the treatment of asthma, «Clinical-
economics analysis of the use of different doses of 
proktant alfa (Curosurf) and beraktanta (Survant) for the 
prevention and treatment of respiratory distress 
syndrome in premature infants, research of 
pharmacoeconomic evaluation of the cost of the disease 
chronic idiopathic urticaria in Russia", conducted HTA 
"The use of drugs for the treatment of influenza", Started 
the clinical and economic trial of the drug "dinaton" for the 
prevention of postoperative paresis bowel, conducted 
HTA «apomorphine» for the treatment of Parkinson's 
disease. 

Describe your Chapter's accomplishments for 2015 with 
regard to Policy-related activities. 

Established the Board of Innovation FMBA of Russia, 2 
round tables were held in the Russian State Duma about 
rare diseases and about the issue of assistance to older 
patients. Applied the application for the development the 
GOST R for clinical and economic analysis. Entered into 
force the GOST R for Health Technology Assessment. 

Describe your Chapter's accomplishments for 2015 with 
regard to Chapter meetings or conferences. 

The Russian branch of ISPORT took an active part in the 
Annual ISPORT meeting in Philadelphia and Milan. Took 
part in the congress of the Polish branch of ISPOR. 
Participation in the III National Conference "A society for 
all ages", 20 international conference "The older the 
patient, the quality of life» and the school-seminar 
"Formulary committee" in Petrozavodsk was organized 
with our company. 

Describe your Chapter's accomplishments for 2015 with 
regard to membership engagement. 

During 2015 we were able to attract 47 new members. 
Number of members of the Russian ISPOR branch is 
increasing - in 2007 - 436 members, in 2008 - 830, in 
2009 - 1106, 2010 - 1197 people, 1327 people in 2011, 
1381 people in 2012, 1561 people in 2013, 2014 - 1684 
people. 

Is your Chapter affiliated with any institutions, 
universities, government or associations (other than 
ISPOR)? If yes, please list and describe the nature of 
these affiliations(s). No 
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The Society of the Pharmacoeconomics and Outcomes 
Research - Nonstandard Constitution 

Does your Chapter collect membership dues or fees from 
individuals for local Chapter membership? If yes, how 
much are the dues? No 

  

How many ISPOR International members (paying dues to 
ISPOR Headquarters) does your Chapter have? Provide 
an estimate if you do not have an exact count. 180 

Does your Chapter have any agreements or sponsorship 
arrangements with any for-profit companies, 
governments, health authorities or associations? If yes, 
please describe. No 

  Does your Chapter employ paid administrative or 
management staff (Association Management Company, 
contracted staff)? No 

Other than the page for your Chapter on the ISPOR 
website, does your Chapter maintain a website? Yes 

 
rspor.ru 

When did your Chapter last update the ISPOR Chapter 
Constitution? In the last 5 years. 

Has your Chapter (as a group, not as individual 
members) submitted formal comments or responses to 
any government or health authority in 2014 or 2015? If 
yes, what was the topic or issue? Yes 

 
GOST R "Health Technology Assessment" 

Does your Chapter (as a group, not as individual 
members) interact in some way with the HTA or other 
official guidelines in your country? If yes, please name 
guideline(s) and describe.  Yes 

 

Health Technology Assessment,  Prevention of bedsores 
and other 

Does your Chapter have any committees or special 
interest groups? Please indicate and briefly describe. No 

  Academia % 55 

Government/HTA Agency % 15 

Industry % 0 

Consulting % 5 

Clinicians % 5 

Student % 10 

Other % 10 

What benefits does your Chapter offers to its members? Membership in our activities  
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What are the most significant achievements of your 
Chapter in 2015? 

Established the Board of Innovation FMBA of Russia, 2 
round tables were held in the Russian State Duma about 
rare diseases and about the issue of assistance to older 
patients. HTA «Sulodexide», HTA «Use of the drug 
Fondaparinux sodium in patients with acute coronary 
syndrome», HTA «Use of the drug «Foster» for the 
treatment of asthma, «Clinical-economics analysis of the 
use of different doses of proktant alfa (Curosurf) and 
beraktanta (Survant) for the prevention and treatment of 
respiratory distress syndrome in premature infants, 
research of pharmacoeconomic evaluation of the cost of 
the disease chronic idiopathic urticaria in Russia", 
conducted HTA "The use of drugs for the treatment of 
influenza", Started the clinical and economic trial of the 
drug "dinaton" for the prevention of postoperative paresis 
bowel, conducted HTA «apomorphine» for the treatment 
of Parkinson's disease. 

What are the greatest challenges facing your Chapter? 
 

How does your Chapter fulfill ISPOR's mission to 
promote health economics and outcomes reseach 
excellence to improve decision making for health 
globally?  Describe how it supports the development and 
promotion of the discipline of health economics and 
outcomes research in your region. Popularization among doctors and government 

How can the ISPOR organization as a whole (Staff, 
Board, Consortia, Networks, etc.) better support your 
Chapter? All fine 

Please indicate who prepared this report, include title, 
phone, email. 

Andrey Vorobiev, Director of Economics, +79096323089, 
andrey.vorobiev@rspor.ru 

 


